
Server / Viewer / Display & AI

Feature HighlightsEBM’s UDE App is our newest iOS-based 
mobile display solution that’s capable of 
converting an iPad Pro into a standalone 
viewer, display, and server- all in one. It offers 
many highly anticipated features, including the 
integration of Artificial Intelligence (AI), an 
extendable reporting system, and more. With 
the UDE App, medical image data from a 
PACS server or modality can be directly trans-
mitted to an iPad Pro via DICOM communica-
tion for display and storage. While away from 
traditional a workstation, a user can deploy the 
UDE App to a pair of iPad Pros with a laptop 
and leverage its viewer mode function, creat-
ing a compact mobile workstation. The 
advancement of this versatile application 
facilitates communication of clinical informa-
tion and overcomes traditional workstation 
barriers for the best possible outcome.

Viewer: Query/Retrieve image data from PACS 
server, capable to display DICOM images.
Server: Receive images from modalities. 
Display: iPad high resolution display.
Meeting mode: Virtual consultation room. 
Mammography hanging protocol.
Image export mechanism.
FDA approval. 

* Optional AI models(for research only).
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About EBM Technologies
EBM Technologies is a leading total solution 
provider of medical imaging systems, special-
ized in picture archiving and communication 
system (PACS) and systems for Personal 
Health Record (PHR) and Electronic Medical 
Records (EMR). Founded in 1988 in Taiwan, 
EBM Technologies has since expanded 
globally with a total of 150 employees and 
more than 3,500 hospitals being installed with 
our PACS across regions of Asia, North 
America, and soon to the Middle East. To 
meet the ever-evolving market demand, we 
have shifted our focus to mobile medical 
applications and AI integration solutions. At 
EBM Technologies, we strive to improve our 
products and services above and beyond 
industry standards for a better future in the 
healthcare sector. To find out more about us, 
visit our website: www.ebmtech.com


